
Call for 
nominations 

A l t o n  E. B a i l e y  A w a r d  

The North Central Section of AOCS is requesting 
writ ten nominations from Society members for the 
1978-79 Alton E. Bailey Award. The purpose of the 
Bailey Award is to recognize research and/or  service 
in the field of  fats and oils. The nominat ion should 
contain at least five pert inent references or contribu- 
tions in the field of oils, fats, waxes, etc. Some of the 
past Bailey Award winners are: V.C. Mehlenbacher 
(1959), R.H. Ports (1960), J.C. Cowan (1961), A.R. 
Baldwin (1963), T.P. Hilditch (1965), D. Swern 
(1966), W.O. Lundberg (1967), H.J. Dut ton (1968), 
H.S. Olcott  (1969), H.E. Carter (1970), J.F. Mead 
(1971), R.T. Holman (1972), C.M. Gooding (1973), 
S.So Chang (1974), W.M. Cochran (1975), Raymond 
Reiser (1976), L A .  Goldblat t  (1977), O.S. Privett 
(1978). 

Please send nominations to the Alton E. Bailey 
Award Chairman, Bart GreenweU, Groen Division of 
Dover Corporation, 1900 Pratt  Blvd., Elk Grove 
Village, IL 60007. The deadline for nominations is 
December 15, 1978, and notif icat ion of the selection 
will appear in this Journal. The presentation of the 
Bailey Award is scheduled for February 1979. 

D e a d l i n e :  D e c e m b e r  15,  1 9 7 8  

Call for 
nominations 

1 9 7 9  H o n o r e d  S t u d e n t  A w a r d s  

Nominations are now being solicited for the 1979 
AOCS Honored Student Awards. Graduate students 
at any North American insti tut ion of higher learning, 
in any area of  science dealing with fats and lipids, 
who are doing research toward an advanced degree, 
and who are interested in the areas of science and 
technology fostered by this Society, are eligible. To 
receive the award, he/she must remain a registered 
graduate student  and must not  have received his/her 
degree or begun career employment  prior to  the 
AOCS meeting he/she is to  attend. Selection of 
awardees is based upon educational qualifications and 
performance. 

The awards provide funds equal to travel costs, 
plus $75.00, to permit at tendance at the national  
meeting of the AOCS to be held in San Francisco on 
April 29 - May 3, 1979. 

Nomination forms may be obtained from AOCS 
Headquarters, 508 S. Sixth St., Champaign, IL 
61820. 

ITMR,.c.I 

C h e m i c a l  E n g i n e e r s ,  C o n s u l t a n t s ,  

Oils ,  F a t s ,  a n d  F a t t y  C h e m i c a l s  

K. C. Joshi 

Suite 1803 
345 West Fullerton 
Chicago, IL 60614 

(312) 525-1557 

Call for 
papers 

7 0 t h  A n n u a l  M e e t i n g  - J o i n t  A O C S - J O C S  

The Technical Program Committee has issued a 
call for papers to be presented at the AOCS Annual 
Meeting. This will be a joint  meeting with Japan Oil 
Chemists'  Society, April 29 - May 3, 1979, at the 
Fairmont Hotel in San Francisco. Papers on every 
aspect of  hpids, oils, and fats, and related areas are 
welcome. Please submit three copies of a 100-300 
word abstract with title, authors, and speaker. Please 
also indicate whether you wish to make the presen- 
tation in the regular manner or in a poster  session. 
The abstracts are to be sent to L.D. McClung, Best 
Foods, Div., CPC International,  San Francisco, CA, 
94110. 

D e a d l i n e :  D e c e m b e r  1, 1 9 7 8  
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